
3" x 1" Corrugations/Plain Galvanized Coatin 5" x 1" Corrugations/Plain Galvanized Coating

DIA. GA. 
PRICE/     

LF.PLAIN SPAN RISE
PRICE/LF/W

/SPAN/R
PRICE/     

LF.PLAIN SPAN RISE
PRICE/LF/W/

SPAN/R
PRICE/     

LF.PLAIN SPAN RISE
PRICE/LF/W

/SPAN/R
16 $50.00 NO BID
14 $58.50 40 X 31 NO BID 40 X 31 NO BID 40 X 31
12 $75.75 40 X 31 NO BID 40 X 31 NO BID 40 X 31

16 $56.75 NO BID NO BID

14 $66.50 46 X 31 NO BID 46 X 31 NO BID 46 X 31
12 $86.30 46 X 31 NO BID 46 X 31 NO BID 46 X 31

16 $63.50 53 X 41 $60.88 53 X 41 NO BID 53 X 41
14 $87.00 53 X 41 $72.67 53 X 41 $74.17 53 X 41
12 $114.00 53 X 41 $98.08 53 X 41 $98.58 53 X 41

16 $83.00 $68.47
14 $99.00 60 X 46 $82.27 60 X 46 $83.77 60 X 46
12 $136.00 60 X 46 $110.63 60 X 46 $112.13 60 X 46

16 $90.00 $75.23
14 $110.00 66 X 51 $89.53 66 X 51 $91.03 66 X 51
12 $140.00 66 X 51 $121.07 66 X 51 $122.57 66 X 51

66" 14 $115.00 73 X 55 $98.88 73 X 55 $100.38 73 X 55

*16 $115.00 81 X 59 $90.23 NO BID
*14 $126.00 81 X 59 $108.22 81 X 59 $109.72 81 X 59
12 $166.00 81 X 59 $146.18 81 X 59 $147.68 81 X 59

78" 14 $134.00 87 X 63 $116.71 87 X 63 NO BID 87 X 63

*16 NO BID NO BID
*14 $145.00 $125.20 NO BID
12 $190.00 95x 67 $168.41 95x 67 NO BID 95x 67

90" 12 $200.00 103 X 71 $180.86 103 X 71 103 X 71

14 $162.00 112 X 75 $142.72 112 X 75 112 X 75
12 $220.00 112 X 75 $193.30 112 X 75 112 X 75 
10 $280.00 112 X 75 $251.05 112 X 75 112 X 75

102" 12 $228.00 103 X 71 $205.17 103 X 71 103 X 71

2.66" x 1/2" CORRUGATION/PLAIN GALVANIZED COATING

DIA. GA. 
PRICE/     

LF.PLAIN SPAN RISE
PRICE/LF/W

/SPAN/R
PRICE/     

LF.PLAIN SPAN RISE
PRICE/LF/W/

SPAN/R
PRICE/     

LF.PLAIN SPAN RISE
PRICE/LF/W

/SPAN/R
16 $28.00 $12.74
14 $28.00 $15.33

16 $27.00 17 X 13 $15.84 17 X 13 $16.84 17 X 13
14 $32.00 17 X 13 $19.16 17 X 13 $20.16 17 X 13

16 $31.00 21 X 15 $18.98 21 X 15 $19.98 21 X 15
14 $35.00 21 X 15 $22.96 21 X 15 $23.96 21 X 15
12 $44.00 21 X 15 $31.57 21 X 15 $32.57 21 X 15

16 $36.00 28 X 20 $25.29 28 X 20 $26.29 28 X 20
14 $43.00 28 X 20 $30.37 28 X 20 $31.37 28 X 20
12 $54.00 28 X 20 $40.62 28 X 20 $41.62 28 X 20

16 $44.00 35 X 24 $31.68 35 X 24 $32.68 35 X 24
14 $51.00 35 X 24 $38.11 35 X 24 $39.11 35 X 24
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Trust the Process Logistics LLCVENDOR Wilson Culverts Burgin Pipe & Supply

RFB #2024-015 CULVERT BID TABULATION 

12 $64.00 35 X 24 $50.84 35 X 24 $51.84 35 X 24

16 $50.00 42 X 29 $38.33 42 X 29 NO BID 42 X 29
14 $59.00 42 X 29 $45.63 42 X 29 $46.63 42 X 29
12 $76.00 42 X 29 $61.87 42 X 29 $62.87 42 X 29
10 42 X 29 NO BID 42 X 29 NO BID 42 X 29

*16 $57.00 49 X 29 $44.31 49 X 29 49 X 29
*14 $67.00 46 X36 $53.29 46 X36 $54.29 46 X36
12 $88.00 46 X36 $72.01 46 X36 $73.01 46 X36
10 46 X36 NO BID 46 X36 NO BID 46 X36

*16 $65.00 57 X 38 57 X 38 57 X 38
*14 $88.00 57 X 38 57 X 38 57 X 38
12 $115.00 57 X 38 57 X 38 57 X 38
10 57 X 38 57 X 38 57 X 38

12 $128.00 64 X 43 64 X 43 64 X 43
10 64 X 43 64 X 43 64 X 43

12 $139.00
10 71 X 47 71 X 47 71 X 47

5" X 1" CORRUGATION/PLAIN GALVANIZED COATING

DIA. GA. 
PRICE/     

LF.PLAIN SPAN RISE
PRICE/LF/W

/SPAN/R
PRICE/     

LF.PLAIN SPAN RISE
PRICE/LF/W/

SPAN/R
PRICE/     

LF.PLAIN SPAN RISE
PRICE/LF/W

/SPAN/R
14 $257.00 $159.83
12 $345.00 $217.03
10 $435.00 128 X 83 $275.79 128 X 83 NO BID 128 X 83

114" 10 137x 87 $291.12 137x 87 NO BID 137x 87

12 $375.00 $236.37 NO BID
10 $483.00 142x 91 $306.45 142x 91 NO BID 142x 91

2.66  CORRUGATION BANDS:

DIA. GA. 
12" H12

15" H12

18" H12

24" H12

30" H12

36" H12

SIX (6) TO ONE (1) SLOPED ENDS CORRUGATION/PLAIN GALVANIZED COATED WITH BANDS

DIA. GA. 
12" H12

15" H12

18" H12

24" H12

30" H12

36" H12

120"

Discount for Pk up @ plant or 

42"

108"

48"

54"

Discount for Pk up @ plant or 3.00%

36"

60"

0.00% 3.00%

UNIT PRICE/LF UNIT PRICE/LF UNIT PRICE/LF
$38.00 $19.11

$48.00 $23.76

$56.00 $28.47

$73.00 $37.94

$88.00 $47.52

$104.00 $57.49

Discount for Pk up @ plant or 0.00% 3.00%

UNIT PRICE/EA UNIT PRICE/EA UNIT PRICE/EA
$127.00 $89.92

$198.00 $138.37

$286.00 $196.37

$441.00 $300.74

Discount for Pk up @ plant or $350.00 3.00%
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$891.00 $594.04
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